
STAGES
Summer Program

Call 989-835-4041 for more information

Begins June 25th
What to Expect 

• Hang outs and/or virtual wellness activity 
will be held weekly (drop-in event.)

• Activities at our Skills CITE (practice 
apartment), teach hands-on independent 
living skills. These are fun-filled activities 
you can do with your peers while also 
learning a bit about independence

• Employment and business tours   

• Fun Friday that includes activities such as 
kayaking, a trip to the Saginaw Zoo, etc.

Calendar

As always, the STAGES calendar is a 
tentative plan for the summer. It will be 
important to have good contact info to keep 
interested people updated as weather could 
affect our schedule. If you have an email that 
is regularly checked please include it. You 
can give us a student one and a parent 
email address if you each have one. 

When our calendar comes out, look over the 
list that follows and choose the activities that 
you think you will want to be involved in and 
fill out your registration form. Your response 
will help us determine the group size to 
expect at each event. Signing up for an 
event does not mean you can’t change your 
mind if something comes up or your job 
interferes. Registration for most events stays 
open until the event occurs; however, there 
may be a few activities that will have limited 
participation, when those events are full 
registration for that event will be closed.

We always make sure to communicate 
changes to those who have signed up. 
Those who sign up will get an email or letter 
with specific details about when and where 
to meet for each event. It will be our intention 
to communicate by email each Monday the 
details of the activities for that week.

https://www.dnmm.org/


STAGES
Summer Program

Registration Form

Call 989-835-4041 for more information

Mail or Drop-off
Disability Network Mid-Michigan
STAGES
1705 Saginaw Road
Midland, MI 48640

Email
jaime@dnmm.org

Student Name ___________________________________________________________________

Parent/Guardian Name____________________________________________________________

Address ________________________________________________________________________

City _______________________________ Zip Code ___________________________________

Parent/Guardian Day Phone | Evening Phone ___________________  |  ___________________

Participant Phone _____________________________________________________________

Best email address to update your family regarding additions or changes

Family email  _____________________________________________________________

Participant email _____________________________________________________________

Is email a reliable way of getting you information?       ■ Yes       ■ No

Have you participated in DNMM summer programs before?       ■ Yes       ■ No

Are you an MRS Customer?       ■ Yes       ■ No

Mark all of the activities in which you wish to participate
You can do as much or as little as you want. (This information assists us in planning) 

■ Crafts       ■ Local Attractions       ■ Indoor       ■ Outdoor         ■ Sports

https://www.dnmm.org/

